
ITEM Price Q1 Q2 Total Points
VENDOR 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 alternate Total

per case

Kelly Paper 26.00 39.70 34.00 28.00 42.05 75.00 86.50 92.30 38.90 36.40 41.70 36.40 35.00 60.80 41.90 30.00 123,301.10 80 10 10 100

Give Something Back 31.53 42.60 54.99 42.99 64.99 121.00 127.00 140.00 91.41 85.50 97.75 67.95 59.75 74.00 45.00 34.05 155,166.25 59 10 10 79

JC Paper 38.00 47.50 56.00 44.00 50.30 87.00 97.80 104.50 45.00 42.00 48.00 42.00 40.00 57.20 53.00 43.00 165,787.60 39 8 10 57

Unisource 41.25 71.50 85.30 67.00 75.75 173.80 195.95 209.00 70.97 66.25 76.00 61.66 58.40 92.40 80.50 59.30 211,867.05 11 6 10 27

Office Max 30.50 65.30 61.08 48.00 no bid 118.76 129.95 140.21 118.56 85.33 no bid 42.67 42.67 47.42 no bid no bid 162,300.48 39 10 10 59
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District Wide Printer and Copier Paper Bid 4CD-20 
BID TABULATION

Buyer:  Rod Herrera
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