BID TABULATION

District Wide Custodial Supplies Bid 4CD-21

Buyer: Rod Herrera

Paper Towels Toilet Tissue Seat Cover Trash Liners Hand Soap
VENDOR 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14 | 15 16 | 17 18 19 | 20
Spotless
Spply no bid | no bid | no bid | no bid| no bid | 38.42  36.29 42.26 27.22 | 18.61 | 18.61 | 32.28 | 30.74 | 30.84 | 29.42 | 38.68 | 30.84 | no bid | no bid| no bid
JC Nelson 21.50 no bid | 19.80 25.60 24.65 | 17.75 | 17.75 | 31.55 | 28.40 A 26.40 | 21.60 26.40 23.20 no bid no bid
20.65 16.88 19.68 18.75 23.02 23.73 | 18.19 | 17.80 14.16 30.98 | 29.98 | 22.04 | 36.75 | 29.98 no bid no bid
Cole
Supply 24.48 @ 22.29 | 31.49 | 26.98 37.48 21.48 18.99 14.23 14.23 23.98 22.47 18.96 nobid 22.96 no bid no bid| no bid
UBS 25.06 @ 23.87 | 22.90 27.62| 42.62 | 29.27 23.65 29.98 32.28 - 35.22 40.30 43.06
item #

1 Roll Towel capacity 800'

2 Single Fold Towel 250 count/pkg

3 Multifold Towel 250 count/pkg lowest bid

4 Perforated Kitchen Roll Towel 100 sheets next lowest bid

5 Standard Toilet Tissue 2-Ply ‘

6 JumboToilet Tissue 2-Ply capacity 2000’

7 JR JRT Toilet Tissue 3.5" x 1000 ft ‘

8 % Fold Seat Covers, 20 pack 250 PER PK

9 Liner (15x9x32) .8 ml

10 Liner (15X9X23) .8 mil

11 Liner (24X23) 8 mil

12 Liner (23X10X39) 1.5 mil

13 Liner (33X39) 1.35 mil

14 Liner (23x20x47) 2.ml

15 Liner (38X58) 1.5 mil |

16 Liner (26X23X50) 4 mil

17 Liner (43 x 47) 2.0 mil

18 Derma Pro Handsoap (800ml)

19 Frosty Blue Hand & Body Soap

20 Frosty Green Antibacterial Soap







